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CYNTHIA JONES ELECTED
Homecoming Queen

The Bird Cage Theatre, on the
grounds of the Last Frontier Ho-
tel, opened October 25, playing
for a consecutive six-week sea-
son. Six Broadway plays with
stock actors and actresses from
Broadway and Hollywood will
star in the leading parts.

Several students from Basic,
Bouplder and Las Vegas high
schools have been chosen to act
as ushers. From Basic, Jean Sla-
ven. Norma Weber, Jean Fuma-
galli, Shirley Swift, Maureen
Paulson and Pat Bordwell and
Chad Combs are serving as
ushers.

Each usher will work one or
two nights; they might even have
an opportunity to perform later.

The Bird Cage Theatre will of-
fer a special admission price mat-
inee of $1 for students and teach-
ers on Saturday afternoons.

The Last Frontier Hotel do-
nated the land. Mrs. Ronnow pur-
chased an old store building from
Mr. Clark's estate, which has
been moved to the site and con-
verted into the present Bird Cage
Theatre.

Each play appears nightly from
Monday to Saturday.

This is an excellent opportunity
for students interested in dra-
matics to see legitimate stage
productions.

November 19:
Football game at Boulder

Basic vs. Boulder
November 20:

Sophomore Reverse
November 24:

Football game here
Basic vs. Hurricane

November 24:
Homecoming Dance

December 10:
Teen-age Dance

December 10:
Lobo News out

The Commercial Club will pre-
sent a fifty dollar scholarship to
the senior shorthand student with
the highest rating at graduation.
This scholarship will enable the
winner to continue her business
education.

Mrs. Warner will give three
standardized shorthand tests. The
student with the highest average
of the three tests will be the
winner.

In order to raise the money for
the scholarship, members plan to
stage a vaudeville revue. Local
school talent will be used.

Try-outs for the show were
held on November 9, 10 and 12
in the Commercial Room. The ex-
act date for the revue will be an-
nounced later.

Cynthia Jones will reign as
Queen for the Basic High home-
coming game November 24. The
football team nominated three
senior girls, from whom the stu-
dent body elected Cynthia Jones.

Cynthia is popular and very
active in school affairs. She was
attendant to the Junior Prom
Queen, Connie Malcolm. She is 5
feet 4 inches tall, has brown hair
and blue eyes.

The 1948 Queen is a native of
Texas, but has resided in Nevada
for five years. She has attended
Basic during her entire high
school career.

The Queen's attendants will be
Bonnie Yeager, Mary Swift, jun-
iors; Joy Konkel, sophomore, and
Judy Galloway, a freshman.

Crowning ceremonies will oc-
cur during the intermission be-
tween halves of the Hurricane
game. Co-captains Chuck Hansen
and Theodore Williams will
crown.

Both teams will stand at atten-
tion during the coronation. The
school band, majorettes and flag
twirlers will provide several
numbers. To complete the festivi-
ties the Pep Club, appearing in
new uniforms of white sweaters
and dark slacks, will execute a
colorful drill.

Every year students and the
community look forward to this
event, which climaxes the foot-
ball season.
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First, we have Joan Dewey.
Joan is 5 feet QVz inches tail, has
brown hair and blue eyes. She
iikes to dance, ride horses and to
swim. Her favoriate pastime is
arguing.

Joan, who is taking a college
prep course, has great enthusiasm
for high school.

Joan's favorite companion i,:;
Peggy Jeffrey.

Next, we have the Freshman
class president, Everett Witt. He
is 5 feet IVz inches tall, has brown
hair and dark brown eyes. His
favorite sports are basketball and
baseball, both of which he plays
well. He also plays a trumpet in
our high band and in the new
swing band.

Witt likes high school very
much. He is taking a college prep
course and intends to enter An-
napolis after his graduation. Good
luck to n. swell guy!

Attention:
Cold waves as you like them

$10 and up
BASfC BEAUTY SHOP

Man of Iron

Shades of night are falling. You
creep to the shower house to get
reaay for practice. You peer fear-
fully about. No Theodore—no
man of iron. You heave a big sigh
of relief, dash into your suit, and
rush out ready lor a nice rough
practice.

What pleasure it gives you to
look at the halfback and see a
real human being made of flesh
and blood. The ball is snapped to
you. Immediately you plow into
the hole where the ball carrier is
running, and begin the gentle
task of mangling him.

As time goes by and the sun
sets slowly in the west, you are
"sorta" sorry that practice is over.
Your sorrow doesn't last long,
however, because tragedy strikes.
In walks Theodore!

He is a smiling, innocent look-
ing youth—wouldn't hurt a fly!
You get dressed and go out on the
field.

Again the ball is snapped—all
eyes are on the quarterback, won-
dering where the ball will go
from there. Suddenly you know.
There it is—a 178-pound mixture
of steel, bone and brawn, heading

straight for you. Your first im-
pulse is to run, but you know
better. Not being able to run, the
next best thing is to have some-
one to use as a blocker. Suddenly
you realize that there is no possi-
bility of escape. You are face to
face, not with Dracula or Wolf-
man, but with Theodore. Uncon-
sciously you bend over to make
the cacle. The sky falls on your
head. You see "The Big Dipper,"
"Little Dipper," "The Northern
Lights" and minor groups of
stars. A feeling of numbness
gradually wears off. A few sec-
onds later you are able to jump
up and run back to position.

One thought remains as the
game goes on. You have tackled
Theodore, and have lived to tell
about it. Numbness gives way to
pain. The warmness in your
mouth turns out to be blood. The
flapping arm that seems to be-
long to someone else is only tem-
porarily ripped loose. The aching
hip is merely broken in two, arid
will, grow back again.

Feeling so thoroughly broken
up, you think tu yourself: "That
'J heodore must be just a little
hurt!" How wrong you are! There
he is, fresh as a daisy, grinning,
and waiting for the next play.

"That's all, boys—take 20 laps
and go in." These words from the
coach seem to come straight from
Heaven.

Dragging your mangled limbs,
you limp toward the shower
house, and so ends another prac-
tice with our friend Theodore.

For shoe repairs
go to the

SHOE HOSPITAL
IN HENDERSON
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Getting a Man
Having observed the dejected-

looking datless girls of Basic
High, I venture to offer sugges-
tions for changing this sad dilem-
na, from my own unprecedented
popularity.

The technique must be varied
to fit the personality of the pro-
spective catch. First, there is the
wolf that howls in the high school
pack. Lure him with a subtle
blend of pucker-paint, perfume
and pulchritude. Coyly prowl his
trail, keeping his roving eyes and
sensitive nostrils at a safe dis-
tance. Soon he will take up the
chase with drooling chops.

Second, is the football Hercules.
Keep a balanced line 'til you re-
ceive or get the kick-off. If he
gets offside, intercept any for-
ward passes just for safety. He
will take time out willingly with-
out unnecessary roughness. Don't
delay the game and you'll be
sure to score.

Third, give the masculine intel-
lectual sponge plenty of that good
old "come-on" to distract him
from his preoccupation with solv-
ing all the problems of the uni-
verse. Listen with rapt attention
while he expounds his pet theo-
ries, inject a few well-timed ex-
clamations, marvel at his genius,
and stifle that yawn charmingly.
He will soon decide you are just
the match he needs to set the
world on fire.

These conclusions are drawn
from 365 evenings a year alone
with my triple-range telescope.

Fine cleaning
ROYAL CLEANERS

Phone Victory Village 1094
We pick up and deliver

November 20

Gold Awards
Some time ago the Lions Club

of Henderson became interested
in the Tri-State League, which
helps to further athletics. With
continued interest, they decided
to present trophies to the winners
in both basketball and football.

These trophies are now on dis-
play in the window of Christen-
sen's Jewelry Shop. The one for
football has a full-sized football
on a pedestal. Beneath the foot-
ball is the figure of a football
player in full garb.

The basketball trophy is of the
same pattern as that of the foot-
ball.

We Are Friends
I lie and rest all day, and at

night I hear what the boys have
.o say. They call me their friend
and tell me their plays.

They talk in front of me all the
ime, 'cause I keeps their secrets
and never even give out with a
sigh. I am really a popular guy,
cause I am the Football of Basic

High.

RECREATION CENTER CAFE
School lunches 50 cents

We make our own pastries

Open from 8:00 to 12:00

To the Rescue
Commercial Club calling F.B.I.
ommercial Club calling F.B.I.!
ost: One orchestra for the Com-

mercial Club dance Saturday
night.

The crowd was waiting in the
gaily decorated gym. The enter-
tainers were ready. No orchestra.
The clock was slowly ticking
away the minutes—5 minutes, 10
minutes, 20 minutes, a half hour.
Still no orchestra.

Suddenly, amid a roll of drums,
the curtain opened. The enter-
tainers put on their program, and
received a hasty applause.

Then to the rescue came Bill
Byrne with a radio-phonograph,
and records. Thanks to him the
dance was a huge success.

******COMPLIMENTS OF

ANDERSON DAIRY

******

BASIC PHOTO MART
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Oooo-www! The Wolves have
really been howiin' around ol'
Basic these last few weeks. Let's
catch up on them!

Could this be "love in bloom"
for Jeanie P. and Duane L.! It
sure " would be swell if your
names could be added to that
long, long list of steadies. How
about it, you two?

Well, here's another couple in
our midst: It's Isrnael and Bonnie
Y., one of Basic's new students
this year. Here's a barrel of luck
to one of BHS's nicest couples!

He loves me—he loves me not!
What's it goin' to be, Pat, or
should we ask Keith?

What's happened to the Melvin
Bailey-Peggy Jefferies combina-
tion? Could it be that Melvin's in-
terest has strayed elsewhere?
Could be!

What's wrong with you junior
girls—can't you gals take cars of
the junior boys? At least that's
the way it seems to us on-
lookers. That Reverse date is
comin' on pretty quick, and if you

Eat at

KING'S BARBECUE

Refreshment
headquarters

want a man for it, you "gotta get
busy"!

Hey, Doris, how's about makin'
up your mind, and ours? Now he
has red hair! Variety is the spice
of life, eh what?

Poor Everett Witt! Every time
he turns around, he bumps into
one of his flames. Always in the
middle, aren't you, Witt?

Bobby M. and Billie Sue G.
look like a likely couple. What
about it, you two?

Well, gals, Jerry K. is still
walking around "free and un-
spoiled" — who's gonna s.et their
trap first? Better get your bid in
early!

What's wrong, Rust? Isn't Jean-
ette good enough for you—or do
you prefer goats?

Hey. Tommy! Can't you and
Mr. Greenfield come to an agree-
ment on this "being late for class
on account of the school band"
business?

Oh, Sherwoo''! There's a rumor
that, you and N-?ncy Otero are
passing notes to each other in the
third period. I thought you and
Shirley Bunch were going steady!

Well, gang, that's all for this
time. If you want to have any-
thing put in Wolf Howls, or know
anyth'ng we don't know—how's
about 'Irippin' it in "Willie's Cor-
ner" in the office? That way
nothing—or should I say nobody?
—is missed!

DEPARTMENT

We welcome your use of cur
Christmas lay-away plan

Compiiments of

TOWNS1TE BARBER SHOP

Phi Beta Sigma: Barbara Hen-
drickson, senior; Barbara Ludwig,
junior; Stanley Phillips, George
Rostine, Don Doughty, Joy Kon-
kel, sophomores.

Honor Roll: Merelle Domina,
Nancy Bell, Barbara Brown,
James Ingram, Roberta Hamblin,
Bobbie Jean Cummins, Barbara
Bancroft, seniors; Shirley Swift,
Dora Godwin, Maureen Powell,
Chad Combs, Jeanne Paulson,
Jean Fumagalii, juniors; Larry
Standert, Robert Bischoff, Betty
Hietbrink, Robert Autry, Billie
Gaither, Patsy Reeves, Tom Sirns,
Charlotte Vincent, sophomores;
Annette Foster, Kay Crawford,
Barbara Holl, Barbara Oncken,
Gerald Kizzia, Jean Slavin, Kay
Goodale, Carol Kosh, Jane Hem-
ington, freshmen.

New School Marm
Hey. all you geniuses and quiz

kids! Have you seen Basic High
School's new math teacher? Her
name is Mrs. Dorothy "D" Boyce.

Mrs. Boyce received her bache-
lor of science degree at Central
Missouri State College and her
master of arts degree at the Uni-
versity of Kansas City.

Mrs. Boyce majored in history,
government and m a t h. She
teaches all math subjects.

Mrs. Boyce likes Basic very
much. She also likes the dry cli-
mate and the view of the moun-
tains. Her only dislike, and I
quote: "I dislike rocks in my
shoes!"

Agents for
PRUDENTIAL LIFE IMS. CO.

Accident, Health and
Hospitalization

Office opposite Victory Theater
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The Basic Wolves tamed the
Needles Mustangs by crushing
them by the score of 31 to 13. The
Wolves set new records by win-
ning this game. First, it was the
highest score made by a Basic
team. Also the first time the
Wolves won four games in a sea-
son, and first time ever to win
two games away from home. The
Wolves still have four games left
in this season.

Basic got off to a great start by
scoring on the second play of the
game. This was made by Lope-
man on a 43-yard gallop to the
goal. The Mustangs came back
hard to score and push across the
extra, and to go ahead 7 to 6 in
the first quarter.

The Wolves then buckled down
and scored twice. These were
made by Lopeman and Galloy/ay.
Doughty came in to kick the ex-
ti-a po;nt. He will not see any
more action except for coming to
kick the extra point, at which he
is an expert. The score at the half
was: Basic 19, Needles 7.

The third period was high-
lighted on a long run by Gallo-
way on an intercepted pass, but
it was called back on a clipping
penalty. The ball was put back on
the Basic 20, from where Lope-
man went off-tackle and ran the
full 80 yards for a Basic tally.
The Wolves opened up with a
strong passing attack and scored
again on a long pass, from Gallo-
way to Hansen good for 25 yards
and a touchdown. When the game
ended, the Wolves were on their
way to another score, but time
ran out. The final score: Basic 31,
Needles 13.

The Basic Wolves' men, after
trailing the Kingman Bulldogs 7
to 0 at half time, came back
strong to score three touchdowns
in the second half and take their
first Tri-State win by the score of
19 to 14.

The first quarter found the
Wolves threatening four times
but they just couldn't seem to
push it over. The Bulldogs took to
the air in the closing minutes of
the first quarter and scored on a
pass into the end zone. They
booted the extra and led 7 to 0.
The second quarter found Basic
threatening again and again but
unable to score. Then, with but 30
seconds left, Williams shot a long
pass to Hansen and it looked as if
he would go all the way, but he
was pulled down from behind on
the 4-yard line. The pass netted
55 yards.

The third quarter found Lope-
man setting up a touchdown by
carrying the bail to the 5-yard
line from v/here Williams charged
across, making the score Basic 6,
Kingman 7.

In the fourth quarter the
Wolves tallied twice and led 19 to
7. But the Bulldogs fought game-
ly and pushed across another
score and the game ended with
the score: Basic 19, Kingman 14.

Feeling discouraged about the
quality of work his new secretary
was turning out, the boss decided
to put her through a quiz. "Did
you ever hear of Harding?" he
asked. "No, sir," she said. "Ever
hear of Hoover?" "No, sir." "Lin-
coln?" "Let me see," she said,
"was his last name Nebraska?"

The Basic Wolves shoved the
Las Vegas Wildcats around for
the first half by making long end
runs, passing and hard drives
through the center of the big
Wildcat line.

The Wolves pushed across a
touchdown early in the first
quarter, which was set up by
Keith Lopeman on a beautiful 28-
yard run to the 4-yard line from
where Basic plunged over for a
Basic score. The first stanza
ended with Basic leading 6 to 0.
The second quarter found Las
Vegas scoring, but Basic held the
Wildcats from then on and the
half ended with the score 6-all.

The Wildcats came back strong
in the second half and scored
twice in the third quarter, which
was due to the large amount of
reserve power, which Basic lacks.
But the Wolves fought hard the
fourth quarter to hold the Vegas
eleven to one score. The game
ended with Las Vegas 24, Basic 6.
This was one of the best games
ever played by the Basic team
against the Las Vegas Wildcats.
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Monkey Business
CAN YOU IMAGINE?

Shirley Chaffee 7 feet tall?

Richard Chandler without a
protest?

Bill Stitt without a wisecrack?

Mr. Athis without his stick?

WANTED 1
One teacher who doesn't give

home work.
One room that is quiet during

study periods.
One science teacher who will

take us on walks.
One teacher who will give par-

ties twice a week.
One history teacher who will

pass out gum during class.

Fourth Grade News
The fourth grade taught by

Mrs. Haynes carried on two in-
teresting and successful experi-
ments in their classroom. The
first was invisible writing with
lemon juice. The second was the
process of making soap. They
mixed lye, fat and water. They
made good, hard soap.

The boys and girls in Miss Ry-

Come in and see us

TURNER AND DOHERTY

Eiqhth Grade News
Today in the 8-A history class

Sandra Smith, Caryn Yeager and
Abigail Odell gave speeches for
Governor Dewey. They were all
good speeches. The democrats in
the room, who are more numer-
ous than the republicans, asked
Sandra questions and defended
Truman. They charged the 80th
Congress as doing nothing. San-
dra answered some of the ques-
tions and a few were answered
by some other republicans. It is
believed that neither side secured
any extra votes.

Bob Ford, one of our best foot-
ball players, left at the beginning
of the second six-week period for
Los Angeles, Calif. Bob was a
tackle on the football team. He
hadn't had a chance to play in a
game before he left. He attended
school in Ely, Nev., before com-
ing here. Bob's father held a job
in California. He was a very good
student and was liked by every-
one. We all miss his fine charac-
ter and personality.
an's room who made 100 on their
spelling tests had a picture of a
funny pumpkin on their papers.
They have a lot of fun at school.

Miss Bryant's fourth grade
moved to a new room this week.
It is room E. There are windows
on both sides of the room so there
are not very many blackboards.
They also have a sink in their
room.

Compliments of

VICTORY THEATER

MILLER, HAYNES AND SMITH, INC.
Architects — Engineers — Contractors

Phone: Henderson 347

First and Second
Grade News

The morning first grade class in
room B were the proud winners
of the monthly P. T. A. attend-
ance prize for the October meet-
ing. With the money they won,
their teacher, Mrs. Clements,
bought a new record for the
phonograph.

Mrs. White's first grade also
had a Halloween party. Mary
Ellen McDonald won the prize
for the funniest costume. Lincoln
Elbert pinned the tail on the cat.
Mrs. Todd and Mrs. Langley, their
room mothers, helped them with
their party. They served refresh-
ments.

They have a new girl in their
room. Her name is Margaret Got-
schall. She came from Carver
Park.

Mrs. Larkin's afternoon class
also had a Halloween party. Some
of their mothers came to help.
They served refreshments. They
did songs and dances and Mrs.
Larkin read to them. They wish
to thank Mrs. Dietrich, Mrs. Viva
Clark and Mrs. Lasson, who had
charge of the party.

They also have a new boy in
their class. His name is Charles
Gotschall. He came from Carver
Park.

Mrs. Raker's second grade in
room D has been having fun
making jack-o'-lanterns. Marga-
ret Butler brought the pumpkins
from her grandfather's ranch.
The children drew faces on the
pumpkins and Mrs. Raker cut
them out.

CHRiSTENSEN JEWELRY
It's not necessary to go farther
for finest watches, diamonds,

jewelry and silverware than
Henderson
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Sixth Grade News
Thursday a f t e r n o o n Mrs.

Glenn, 6-A English teacher, was
called away. Sandra Smith and
Nelda Prince took over the class.
During the afternoon the class
talked about their hobbies, and a
few of them were exhibited.
Some of the hobbies were: Col-
lecting match books, knives, dolls
and rocks.

The 6-A Club has chosen new
officers. They are as follows: Don
Lester, president; Gilbert Gall-
yois, secretary; Gail Scott, treas-
urer. The class will elect new of-
ficers every month. 6-A also has
a new librarian. She is Hazel
Flock.

Edward Innis, Barbara Shep-
Bpard and Penny Crane were
busily decorating for the Hal-
loween party. They had it Friday
afternoon. They bobbed for ap-
ples and played many games. A
prize of a pumpkin was given for
the best costume. Their refresh-
ments were cookies and cider.

We had a party Friday, Octo-
ber 29, in Mrs. Wright's room for
Halloween. We in the 8-C are
thankful to the room mothers,
Mrs. Small, Mrs. Archibald, Mrs.
Jefferson and Mrs. Erickson.

Mrs. Wright, 6-A history teach-
er, is very interesting. She told
us that at the Nevada state peni-
tentiary there is a footprint of a
dinosaur named Sloot. If you like,
you can find all about them in the
Nevada history books.

Hi, kids! Isn't it much easier to
get acquainted with the next fel-
low if you know something about
him? Here are more personalities,
just for you:

Our first personality today is
that of Don Warren. He is 5 feet
5 inches tall, has brown eyes and
brown hair. Don is a very good
football player on our team. I
think if he would ever decide to
leave Henderson, school wouldn't
be like school anymore, 'cause he

Compliments of

BELL REALTY
Home Office Bonanza Village

Las Vegas, Nevada

The planes you heard and saw
October 27 flew from San Diego,
Calif., for Navy Day. They flew
in formation over the Henderson
lementary school. They had

done aerial maneuvers over Las
Vegas and were on their way to
the Grand Canyon. They were
guests at a banquet given in their
honor at the Flamingo Hotel in
Las Vegas.

S
Editor Nelda Prince
Associufs Editor Sandra Ss.iith
Business Manager Lyndsl Berry
Reporters Dorothy Crofts,

Patricia Simmons, Mary Goff, Andrea
Sewoll, Donna Lee Bogut, Margie
Mainor, Bruce Austin, Barbara Jones,
Mary Sanchez, Dick Bordwall, Frank-
lin Heatly, John Staley, Vevy Laws-
well, Carol Rowlings, Arlene Resko,
Myrtle Wand.

Advisor Miss Kling

Compliments of

ART KLINGER'S

SERVICE STATION

is forever cracking jokes. (Pretty
good ones, too!) And he has a
loud laugh that we just couldn't
get along without.

Next personality is that of
Thelma Minor, known to everyone
as Mickie. She is 5 feet 4 inches
tall, has brown hair and big blue
eyes. Mickie is one of the pret-
tiest girls in our class and one of
the nicest. She is a very good
student and is always in a good
sense of humor.

Now comes Audrey Domina.
She is the girl who can take a
joke and give one at the same
time. She has brown eyes and
light brown hair. She is lots of
fun.

Ramona Church is our next
personality. She is 5 feet 2^
inches tall, has light auburn hair
and is cute. She has quite a per-
sonality and you're sure to like
her.

Now here's a personality you
can't go wrong on. She's the pop-
ular Sandra Smith from 8-A. She
is 5 feet tall, has dark brown hair
and blue eyes. She takes an ac-
tive part in school activities and
is not hard on the eyes.

And last, but certainly not the
least, is Edward Marley. He has
blond hair, blue eyes and a broad
smile. He is quite fond of girls,
one in particular we believe, and
he is very nice.
Anderson, who moved to Las Ve-
gas. The two new students are
Sharon Pickand, who came from
Caliente, Nev., and Martha Engle,
from Stockton, Calif.

Mrs. Cruther's class had a Hal-
loween party. They told stories,
poems and sang songs. They also
played games and had refresh-
ments. The room had been deco-
rated quite attractively. This was
done by the committee chosen by
Mrs. Crutcher. Members of this
committee are Lane Merryweath-
er, Frank Porter, John Heming-
ton, Jane Walker and Donna Lee
Bogut.
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New Students
This morning Coach Taylor

came in the 8-B class with a new
student named Johnny Brown. A
few minutes later he came in
with two more, named Billy Pick-
ard and Ellwood Purdy. Coach
explained that it was getting kind
of crowded but we have a very
small class this year so we're very
glad to have new students.

Johnny Brown is a nice look-
ing boy about 5 feet 8Va inches
tall. He has dark brown hair and
light brown eyes. Johnny said he
had never attended this school
before. The last school he attend-
ed was St. Mary's School in Med-
iord, Ore.

Billy Pickard is 5 feet 1V2

inches tall. He has light brown
hair and blue eyes. The last
school he attended was in Cali-
ente, Nev. Billy has never been in
the Henderson school before,
either.

Our last, but certainly not
least, new student is Ellwood
Purdy. The last school he attend-
ed was in Woodland Hills, Calif.
He has dark brown hair and
greenish brown eyes.

Let's get acquainted with the
new boys. What about it, gang?

Sports Highlightsr *? 9
Last Saturday, October 30, at

2 p. m. Henderson played Las Ve-
gas, on our field. It was a good
game and the second string was
giving Vegas a. rough game. Ve-

gas came back stronger in the
third quarter but was not strong
enough. The Basic team was not
as good as it was against Boulder
because the line was not charg-
ing. Las Vegas had a shifty back-
field but it didn't foul the line.

Gilbert Gallyios went over for
three touchdowns. He made all
three of them. Homer Thomas
made one touchdown and Paul
Southers made three first and
tens in the last quarter. Hender-
son won 26 to 7.

Third Grade News
The children in Mrs. King's

third grade dressed in costumes
for their Halloween party. Some
were very funny, some were very
beautiful. They had a little pro-
gram for entertainment. Our
mothers furnished delicious re-
freshments. They made their own
decorations and had a lot of fun.

They had two new boys. Rich-
ard Howard, from the Boulder
City school, and Richard Mallory,
from Vallejo. Calif. Richard Mal-
lory went to school here last
year.

Cynthia O'Dell is no longer
with them. She is attending the
Catholic school in Las Vegas.
They all .miss Cynthia.

The third grade pupils enjoyed
their Halloween party Friday.
The room mothers, Mrs. C. True-
worthy and Mrs. L. Fields, had
planned refreshments and were
assisted by five other mothers,
who sent cookies, cup-cakes and
candy.

The Junior High is holding a
mock election on November 2
under the supervision of Mrs.
McMillin, our history teacher.
The rooms will vote separately
since we cannot assemble as a
group. There are ballot commit-
tees, vote - counting committees,
booth committees and many oth-
ers. Many students are busy pre-
paring campaign speeches for
Governor Dewey, President Tru-
man, Governor Thurmond and
Mr. Wallace. We are submitting
to the same election laws as those
of our country. Several students
havt not been in Clark County
long enough to vote.

They are putting posters up in
all the rooms. Some posters state
parts of the party platforms while
others show facts in the form of
illustrations.

Mrs. Law's lifth grade had a
visitor from Texas. Her name is
Mrs. Henderson, Mrs. L a w ' s
sister.

Also, Mrs. Law now has two
new students in her class. How-
ever, four members of the class
have left. Persons leaving were:
Wanita Hicks, who went to Mis-
souri; Vernon Kolster, who went
to Kansas; Louelle Allman, who
went to California, and Janice
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